



Treasurer-Tax Collector Ventura County

Public Auction Results

May 22, 2015

ITEM	APN	MIN BID	WINNING BID	PURCHASER
B (54,61 & 62)	645-0-082-010			
	645-0-091-110			
	645-0-091-120	\$16,550.00	\$16,550.00	MICHAEL GAIL VOIGHT
C (55, 56, 57, 58, 59 & 63)	645-0-091-020			
	645-0-091-030			
	645-0-091-040			
	645-0-091-050			
	645-0-091-060			
	645-0-091-130	\$16,500.00	\$16,500.00	MICHAEL GAIL VOIGHT
D (64 & 65)	646-0-099-040			
	646-0-099-050	\$15,300.00	NO BID	
E (71 & 72)	649-0-010-010			
	649-0-020-010	\$9,600.00	NO BID	
F (76, 77, 78, 79, 80 & 90)	649-0-320-130			
	649-0-320-140			
	649-0-320-170			
	649-0-320-180			
	649-0-320-190			
	649-0-320-330	\$47,500.00	NO BID	
G (81, 82, 83, 84 & 91)	649-0-320-220			
	649-0-320-230			
	649-0-320-240			
	649-0-320-250			
	649-0-320-340	\$38,300.00	NO BID	
H (85, 86, 87, 88 & 89)	649-0-320-260			
	649-0-320-270			
	649-0-320-280			
	649-0-320-290			
	649-0-320-300	\$42,950.00	NO BID	
1	003-0-102-510	\$3,250.00	\$3,250.00	DEBORAH ANN TODD

2 & 3	003-0-112-030 003-0-112-520	\$5,400.00	\$5,400.00	DEBORAH ANN TODD
5	003-0-250-440	\$9,100.00	NO BID	
10 & 11	052-0-083-160 052-0-083-170	\$215,700.00	\$355,000.00	JONATHAN SOLIEMAN BAHARVAR
20	129-0-072-175	\$7,550.00	\$280,000.00	KHOREN MURADYAN
24	183-0-100-405	\$123,500.00	\$123,500.00	DANIEL TODD HEWSON
28	200-0-291-325	\$215,650.00	\$215,650.00	KHOREN MURADYAN
30	201-0-272-040	\$42,000.00	\$44,000.00	BEHZAD RABIZADEH
37	214-0-060-185	\$6,200.00	NO BID	
46	621-0-021-015	\$13,700.00	NO BID	
53	644-0-130-060	\$3,700.00	NO BID	
60	645-0-091-070	\$4,900.00	NO BID	
67	647-0-050-100	\$13,900.00	NO BID	
68	647-0-065-030	\$9,900.00	NO BID	
69	648-0-095-010	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	LISJE LIMPO
70	648-0-097-100	\$21,150.00	NO BID	
74	649-0-108-290	\$20,500.00	NO BID	
75	649-0-108-310	\$38,500.00	NO BID	

For more information or updates about the Public Auction please visit our web site at

www.ventura.org/ttc/auction.